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Joining T he Federal Council
A GENERAL CONVENTION TOPIC

By
RT. REV. CHARLES FISKE, D. D.

M Y , SUBJECT is the proposal 
which is to be made again at 

General Convention to associate this 
Church with the Federal Council of 
the Churches of Christ in America. 
Behind the effort to carry us into 
this federation are some very good 
men, notably one bishop whom we 
all admire and love, whose opinion 
carries great weight in the House of 
Bishops. Nevertheless I am against 
the proposal. Let me state my ob­
jections frankly and without minc­
ing matters.

IT IS PROTESTANT
In the first place, I do not like the 

federation, because it is Protestant. 
When I say that, I do not mean, of 
course, that I dislike Protestant 
ministers or members of Protestant 
denominations. Many of them are 
splendid people; some of them I feel 
honored to number among my 
friends. When I say that I do not 
like the Federal Council of the 
Churches of Christ because it is 
Protestant, I mean that the very fact 
of its protestantism Is a prophecy 
of its failure as a step towards real 
union. Protestantism does not 
make up more than one-third of the 
Christian population of the world 
and to line up this one-third and 
leave out the other two-thirds makes 
for dis-unity rattier than for unity.
# Of course we begin this discus­

sion with the clear understanding 
that the Episcopal Church is not 
Protestant in the ordinary sense of 
the word. We are Protestant, in 
that centuries ago we registered our 
protest along with other protesting 
bodies against certain errors of 
faith, certain accretions of belief, 
and certain superstitions in practice 
which had crept into the Church. 
But in popular usage, the word 
Protestant now means anti-Catholic.

I am not that; nor is the Episcopal 
Church. Ours is a Catholic Church 
with a mission to Protestantism. Al­
most all of its internal disorders and 
discomforts are due to the fact that 
it has this peculiar mission and that 
such a mission, in our present sur­
roundings, carries with it great re­
sponsibilities and obligations accom­
panied, as opportunities always are, 
by grave dangers.

ENDANGER OUR POSITION 
Because I believe that this is a 

Catholic Church with a peculiar mis­
sion to Protestants, I feel that any 
alliance with Pan-Protestantism 
which separates us .from the great 
Catholic communions and identifies 
us completely with all Protestant 
communions of whatever shade of 
belief, would be a betrayal of our 
trust, would do actual harm where 
our purpose is to help and would 
hopelessly compromise our real po­
sition. We have sympathetic asso­
ciations with both the Catholic 
world and the Protestant world, real 
appreciation of the virtues of both, 
have endeavored to assimilate the 
truths for which they stand, and, if 
we are true to our convictions, can 
do more for the cause of Church 
unity by consistent teaching of the 
essentials of faith than through any 
Protestant alliance. Such an alliance 
would amount, practically, to a dec­
laration that we are Protestants of 
the same type as all the rest of the 
Protestant world and that we have 
nothing to distinguish us from others 
except a somewhat finicky desire for 
a worship that is dignified and in 
good taste.

STRENGTH OF CHURCH 
The real strength and influence of 

this Church lies in its faithful ad­
herence to Catholic truth and prac­
tice. If you will read history, you

will see that Catholic revivals in the 
Church have always meant renewal 
of life. Periods of unrestrained 
Protestant influence have been dead­
ening beyond the power of words 
to express. We have always done 
more for others as we have been 
true to ourselves. We can do little 
or nothing for anybody if we are 
merely to be a weak, amiable peo­
ple without backbone; afraid to 
commit ourselves to the things for 
which we really stand; most of all, 
fearful of speaking out loud about 
things over which everybody knows 
that we and those around us differ.

ANOTHER OBJECTION
Affiliation with the Federal Coun­

cil of Churches means official co­
operation with all Protestant bodies 
represented in the Council in the 
work of evangelization and in mis­
sionary work abroad, often in Ro­
man Catholic countries where the 
missionaries are as zealous in at­
tacking Catholic Christianity as in 
planting their own type. It means 
affiliation with local and state coun­
cils of Churches. It means coop­
eration in Christian education and 
temperance reform, with all the ex­
cesses of legislation for which the 
latter is responsible. It means a 
common programme for relations 
with European Churches and espe­
cially French and Belgian Churches.

All these things are now a part 
of the definite work of the Council 
through its commissions. In none 
of them can we join as a Church, in 
a corporate capacity, working on 
the lines already laid down or likely 
to be settled in the future. If we 
commit to any representatives the 
power to determine the Church’s at­
titude on some of these questions, 
we shall run the risk of splitting 
the Church itself. There are num-
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erous clergy and faithful laymen 
who will not consent to remain in a 
Church which identifies itself with 
local federation, delimiting of ter­
ritory, recommending our people to 
worship elsewhere, attacking Ro­
man Catholics, pursuing any further 
a mad career of puritanical legisla­
tion, or forming entanglements in 
ecclesiastical alliances abroad which 
may undo the patient work of those 
who for decades have been working 
for a better' understanding with lib­
eral Catholics.

MUST BE HONEST
It is time that we began to un­

derstand that the true path to Chris­
tian unity does not lie through a 
wilderness of make-believe. The 
best approach to unity is through 
firmer convictions, honestly held and 
as honestly explained, together with 
earnest and prayerful effort to un­
derstand the convictions of others. 
We shall never get unity by delib­
erately concealing convictions. In­
stead, - we shall soon discover that 
our intellectual dishonesty has left 
us with no worth-while convictions 
to express.

If associating ourselves with the 
Federal Council meant only a step 
by which we could come into closer 
contact with the life and work of 
the great Protestant communions, 
no one could object to the move. 
Through the Department of Social 
Service we are already so associated 
with the Council. This proposal 
means more; it means identifying 
ourselves with the Council, and it 
can mean nothing but that, however 
many explanatory resolutions we 
may pass telling the world and the 
Council that we are joining in a dif­
ferent way.

That is not the way towards unity. 
Unity cannot be hastened by rising 
with the cheer leader and singing in 
chorus, “ Now! Everybody get to­
gether !”

EXAMPLES
We have had a striking example 

of the practical results of “ get to­
gether” plans of reunion in the re­
cent career of a New York preach­
er who has brought about a tragic 
cleavage in one denomination and is 
now disrupting another. I speak of 
it because it is a practical, concrete 
example- of what many people mean 
by church unity. He is a man 
whose sincerity, ability, honesty of 
purpose, and piety need not be ques­
tioned. Many admire him for his 
prophetic powers and have paid glad 
tribute to his devotional spirit, his 
insight into the processes of the 
modern mind, and his singular abil­
ity to reach the hearts and con­
sciences of youth. We are sorry 
that controversy is turning his op­
ponents into bitterness of antagon­

Our Cover

Edward Makin Cross, the Bish­
op of Spokane, was born in Phil­
adelphia in 1880. He graduated 
from the Philadelphia Divinity 
School in 1908, and immediately 
took up his work in the mission 
field at Sturgis, South Dakota. 
In 1910 he became the rector, of 
St. Peter’s, Sheridan, Wyoming, 
where he remained until 1916 
when he was called to be the rec­
tor of the Church of St. John the 
Evangelist at St. Paul, Minnesota. 
He was consecrated Bishop of 
Spokane a year ago.

ism; we are even more sorry to see 
its inevitable effect upon himself.

Allowing all that his admirers say 
about his splendid gifts— and gladly 
making the acknowledgment because 
many of us have joined in their ad­
miration— what kind of a church will 
his new church be? It will be a sep­
arate organization loose and unat- * 
tached and as such held together 
only by affection for him and grat­
itude for what he has done in meet­
ing the intellectual problems of the 
present age. It will be just one 
more congregation added to the hun­
dreds that have broken away from 
the unity of corporate Christianity.

LOOSE MEMBERSHIP
Membership in this church will be 

open to all, whether baptized by 
immersion, by pouring or sprinkling, 
or not baptized in any way. Mem­
bership can be retained by those who 
desire Holy Communion and those 
who reject it; by those who wish to 
use wine in celebrating the Lord’s 
Supper and by those who think 
Christ would have used unfermented 
grape juice, “ had He known how 
great the drink evil would become.” 
(Sic). Some will still believe in an 
infallible Book and some will have 
rejected the doctrine so completely 
as to have no belief in any special 
revelation. Some will accept Jesus 
Christ as God and some will say He 
was a man. Some will believe in 
His bodily resurrection and some 
will say that “ His spirit still sur­
vives.”  Some will believe that we 
have a reliable report of His teach­
ing; others will declare that it has 
been colored and changed in the 
record. Some will believe only in 
“ the spirit and purpose of Jesus,”  
while others who worship Him as 
deity will be praying to Him in the 
ambiguous language that satisfies 
the rest.

CANNOT LAST
I am not discussing now, the ques­

tion of who is right and who is

wrong about these things. I am 
merely saying that a union patched 
up out of such discordant elements 
cannot be lasting. And I am also 
insisting that those who favor that 
sort of a union inevitably end in the 
assumption that nothing can really 
matter if we want to serve Christ. 
I don’t believe that. I believe that 
the real trouble with the world to­
day is loss of strong faith in Christ’s 
divine authority and that with this 
has come the loss of any real incen­
tive to follow His way of life. We 
shall never really serve Him unless 
We really believe in Him.

I cannot see how those like my­
self could long be content with a 
nebulous faith and practice like this. 
To go the way of Pan-Protestantism 
would be the first step on the road 
that leads to this cave of negations. 
Therefore I am against joining the 
Federal Council of the Churches of 
Christ. If one congregation and one 
preacher reach so tragic a conclu­
sion through liberality, falsely so 
called, how can there be hope of 
better results on a large scale, prac­
ticed by churches, not congrega­
tions?

SOCIAL SERVICE
Yes, but someone will say that I 

misunderstand the proposal and am 
tilting against windmills of my own 
erection. Someone will say that the 
Federation is not a Christian unity 
scheme but simply a friendly asso­
ciation for uniting all denominations 
in Christian work and service, espe­
cially for service of a community 
character and for such work as will 
unite Christian people in state, na­
tional and world welfare movements.

We have seen that it may mean 
much more; but, if that is all it does 
mean, again I say that we are al­
ready represented as far as we need 
to be through the Social Service De­
partment of the National Council. 
Even were its work purely social, I 
should not be greatly enamored of 
it. I doubt the wisdom of corporate 
action by the churches on social, in­
dustrial and economic questions. The 
men who make decisions on these 
matters can never really represent 
their constituency and inevitably 
they commit their churches to pro­
grammes which have never received 
the support of that constituency. 
Christian citizens should exert every 
possible influence to mould the pol­
icy of the state or nation and purify 
the government of their own cities. 
They exert this influence as individ­
uals or groups of individuals. There 
is no other way in which they can 
properly exert it with any degree of 
success, certainly not as actually 
representing the church member­
ship of their different denomina­
tions.
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Consider the objects for which the 
Federal Council is now working 
through its commissions on social 
service, on international justice and 
good will, and. on race relations. Our 
Social Service Department is coop­
erating with these commissions. It 
is doing all that possibly can be done 
for these several causes. Neither 
the General Convention nor any 
committee chosen to represent it 
could properly authorize larger co­
operation than we have now.

DIFFER ON METHOD
This is because practically all 

moral problems have their moral 
side and their practical side. Es­
sentially, the issue is moral; but the 
programme through which morality 
is to be applied to public questions 
is practical. On the morals of the 
question, we may all agree; on the 
methods of practical solution we 
may rightly differ.

It is difficult to make enthusiastic 
persons see this clearly; but perhaps 
an example (even though it be one 
about which there have been bitter 
differences of opinion) will illus­
trate the point. When the contro­
versy over the League of Nations 
was in progress, thousands of us felt 
that the leaders of the Senate were 
betraying the real ideals of America 
in preventing the acceptance of the 
Treaty of Peace. We were not mere­
ly justified in expressing our con­
victions, we were under a moral ob­
ligation to do all in our power to 
support Mr. Wilson and the Treaty. 
As a Christian citizen I spoke my 
mind emphatically; but as a mem­
ber of the House of Bishops I had 
no authority to vote for a resolution 
urging the Senate to accept the 
Peace Treaty. As representing 
others, I had no commission to ad­
vance the treaty; as an individual I 
gladly signed a petition favorable to 
it.

Nor had the deputies to the Gen­
eral Convention or to a Diocesan 
Convention any authority to vote 
for any resolution endorsing the 
League or advocating the Treaty. 
We must always distinguish between 
moral principles and their practical 
application in any programme of re­
form, political, industrial or social. 
Though it is hard to know just where 
to draw the line, nevertheless we 
must try to make the distinction.

Probably the majority of the 28,- 
000 communicants in my own dio­
cese were opposed to President Wil­
son. They were Republicans and 
they voted with glad acclaim for the 
estimable Mr. Harding. 1 was con­
vinced in my own mind of their po­
litical obtuseness; but what author­
ity had I to send any resolution on 
the subject in their name? All I 
could do was to speak out my per-

Rev. R. Bland Mitchell 
Will Be Heard at New Orleans

sonal convictions and I did so at 
some risk to my own popularity in 
this particular section of the Em­
pire State. It happened, as it usu­
ally happens, that I was honored for 
standing by my convictions, though 
probably I was supposed to be as ob­
tuse as I believed the other people to 
be. Good men like George Wharton 
Pepper (among the laity) and Bish­
op Lawrence (among the clergy) 
may have known more about the 
subject than I did, may have been 
just as anxious for America to ful­
fill its world destiny so far as honor 
summoned her to a world task, and 
yet they differed from me as to the 
actual means by which what we both 
desired could be brought about. By 
what authority could the House of 
Bishops legislate on the matter on 
behalf of a Church of which Mr. 
Pepper and thousands of others like 
him were faithful communicants, 
with any real claim to speak for its 
membership?

MANY THINGS DISAPPROVED 
If the whole House of Bishops 

cannot represent the Church in 
enunciating programmes for the em­
bodiment of moral principles, cer­
tainly no office representatives in a 
council of churches should be al­
lowed to represent us. As a matter 
of fact, many things have been done 
by the Council which have aroused 
serious disapproval. In any federa­
tion of churches, our own communi­
on will be a relatively small group. 
Certainly we have no desire to be 
recorded as approving all the propa­
gandist movements of religious

America. With regard to many of 
these programmes, the Protestant 
communions and our own people are 
as widely apart as the poles.

I know, to be sure, that we may 
be allowed to enter the Federal 
Council “ with reservations,”  and to 
continue to act “ with reservations” 
after we get in. Once in, that fact 
will be overlooked by the mass of 
people. Once in, we shall receive 
credit (or discredit) for everything 
that the Federation does, whether 
we have expressed our reservations 
or not. May I be pardoned for say­
ing it; but once in, we may easily 
be made the victims of shrewd po­
litical manipulators in at least two 
ecclesiastical organizations who 
know every kind of ecclesiastical 
politics, from the common or gar­
den variety, up, down and across.

MEANING OF FEDERATION
For these and many other reasons, 

I refuse to be hypnotized. The Gen­
eral Convention may succumb. Only 
the laity saved us three years ago. 
Let us hope they will again stand 
firm.

The argument from the Catholic 
viewpoint may not appeal to them. 
One would suppose that it might 
have weight, because in our own com­
munion we have had a remarkable 
illustration of the fascination of a 
false liberality and those of the laity 
to whom I have spoken have not 
expressed themselves as pleased with 
it. I refer, of course, to the ease 
with which certain members of the 
Commission on the Ministry suc­
cumbed to the suggestion of closing 
our weak village churches, giving 
occasional sacramental services and 
meanwhile advising attendance at 
neighboring houses of worship. How 
any real Churchman, who knew any­
thing about village or rural work, 
could have joined in such a sugges­
tion is a mystery. Probably most of 
the Commission knew little or noth­
ing of the problem of the small 
church. I know a lot about it, and 
I know that there cannot be found 
anywhere a more faithful and de­
vout people than the members of 
such congregations. They put the 
city people to shame. They love 
their Church, work for it, sacrifice 
for it, stand by it often at a loss of 
social prestige and business profit. 
The drift from the country to the 
village, from the village to the town, 
from the town to the city, brings 
many of them eventually to large 
city parishes and often they form 
the backbone of its strength. Let 
any city rector count the number of 
his people who are city born and 
those who are country born. Let 
him estimate their relative value to 
the parish. Let him picture what
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Q u e s t i o n s  T h a t  I H a v e  B e e n  A s k e d
By

BISHOP JOHNSON
W HY SOCIAL CLUBS FOR CHURCHES?

the parish would be without these 
men and women from the country, 
superior in love and loyalty us they 
usually are. Then let him ask 
whether his parish can afford to vote 
for delimiting territory, closing 
churches, bidding our people go 
elsewhere, in a few instances invit­
ing others to come to us, only to 
have them absolutely refuse or to 
have the parson wish they had done 
so! Let him ask whether he wants 
to dry up the springs that flow to his 
own parish.

This is what the Federation 
means, somewhere along the road, 
even if there be no sign posts at the 
first turn declaring the fact. That 
is why I do not like the Federation. 
It is ungracious to go in unless we 
are willing to “ play the game.”  It 
is not ungracious to say “No”  po­
litely and just as politely state the 
reasons for the refusal. But we 
Episcopalians are an amiable folk; 
we hate to say no, whatever the cir­
cumstance in which we may be 
placed.

Here and now, or later, we shall 
have to decide whether we are going 
to be Catholics, or Protestants, or 
neither; whether we are going to be 
Catholic enough to help the Protest­
ants to whom we have a real mis­
sion; or whether we are going to be 
Protestant enough to kill the Epis­
copal Church forever; whether we 
are going t© be so rampageously 
Catholic with a K (and an R) as to 
amuse everybody all around, and 
eventually be split into two com­
panies.

I said that the argument for a 
true Catholicity might not appeal to 
the laity. I am sure that the other 
argument will— the argument that 
even if the Federation is for social 
work only it is more than likely to 
pledge us to policies of which most 
of the members of the Church d o . 
not approve. Perhaps the laity are 
hs weary of the activities of some 
social reformers as I am and the 
consideration of this second point 
may somehow show them the danger 
of the present proposals. I hope 
and pray that it may.

NOTICE

The Clergy and Parishes in the 
vicinity of New Orleans desiring the 
assistance of the Committee on Min­
isterial Supply in securing preach­
ers on the Sundays during the Gen­
eral Convention, are asked to com­
municate with the Rev. A. R. Berk­
eley, Saluda, North Carolina, as soon 
as possible.

The assignments for the New Or­
leans Churches have been com­
pleted, and many appointments made 
for nearby parishes.

READER of The Witness writes 
to ask why the churches of a 

certain large city are turned into 
social clubs so that those who are 
seeking the grace of God in their 
lives hunt in vain for a single church 
in which the grace of God has pre­
eminence over human culture?

This stricture seems to us rather 
severe and indicates a censorious at­
titude toward the Church because of 
the limitations of Church people, of 
which I cannot approve.

The Master never found fault 
with the Temple, which was His 
Father’s house, and he used it con­
stantly for spiritual purposes, even 
though the priests and Pharisees 
were perverting it to their own 
glorification. There is no question, 
however, in my own mind that there 
is a sound basis for criticism in 
these words, not of the Church but 
of Church leaders.

It is a subtle and insidious dan­
ger which has pervaded the Church 
ever since the Georgian period, 
when the Church was more or less 
dominated by that earthborn trinity 
of dullness, snobbishness and arro­
gance which proceeds from the dis­
proportion given to mere wealth in 
a materialistic world.

It is so easy to change the Church 
from a house of refuge for sinners, 
the poor and the discouraged into 
an ethical cultural society for the 
respectable, the prosperous and the 
self-satisfied that one scarcely real­
izes the transition until it has been 
accomplished.

Indeed there are parishes in which 
the attitude of clergy and people is 
that social culture is a near-religion 
which is the permissible substitute 
for the too intoxicating spirit of 
Christian fraternity, which has in it 
too great a percentage of vulgarity 
for their consumption. (Vulgarity 
i s ' from “ vulgus,”  meaning the 
crowd.)

It is so easy to feel the pagan 
Platonic philosophy slightly diluted 
with a dash of Christian ethics as a 
modern substitute for the comradie 
of the Gospel, that it deceives even 
the very elect and deludes even 
those who have taken Holy Orders.

Clergymen, after all, are nothing 
more than theological students who 
have been ordained, and there is 
nothing inspiring in the average 
theological seminary, which is far 
more concerned with the intellectual 
qualifications in spiritual philos­
ophy than in providing their stu­
dents with enough tribulation that

they may overcome the natural 
worldliness of us all.

They are rather apt to emerge in­
to a conscious sense of their own 
rectitude; a blind confidence in 
their academic philosophy; and 
scarcely a speaking acquaintance 
with the conflicts of life.

They are often like the rich young 
man in the Gospel, quite loveable 
but ignorant of self-sacrifice.

They graduate into a competitive 
race for clerical promotion in which 
vestries composed of influential lay­
men award the prizes on the ground 
of certain social accomplishments 
rather than spiritual victories, and 
they grow to learn that ecclesiasti­
cal tailors and social conventions are 
very important items in their spir­
itual promotion.

There is a lack of hardness in the 
process which lulls them into a 
sense of security by which they per­
suade themselves that the rules of 
social convention are on the same 
plane as the Ten Commandments, 
and much more practical than the 
Sermon on the Mount. It is a line 
of least resistance which furnishes 
us with gentlemanly spiritual guides 
rather than courageous spiritual 
leaders. All o f this does not mean 
that one can take too seriously the 
censorship implied in this criticism, 
for no one is excused from his or 
her duty because someone else is 
failing in his. The grace of God is 
not dependent upon the character 
of clergy or congregations and can 
be obtained from secularized clergy 
ministering to selfish congregations, 
if the one involved is more intent 
on confessing his own sins than 
those of others.

The Church is the Body of Christ 
and is never made inoperative by 
the conduct of His servants. I f we 
are really seeking for the grace of 
God we can find it wherever He has 
promised it; but it is true that the 
leaders of the Church, both prom­
inent rectors and influential laymen, 
need to learn that Christ never will 
balance His accounts on the basis 
of how many are gathered together, 
nor how much they give, nor how 
correctly they follow social conven­
tions; but rather how they use these 
assets to comfort the discouraged, 
to cheer the forsaken, to draw in 
the penitent, to preach the Gospel 
to the poor.

After all, a large rich church 
which pays its rector a large salary, 
has a pretentious income and in­
cludes the most prominent citizens
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in the community among its parish­
ioners, will be in a bad way at the 
conclusion of business if it has been 
outdone by a group of Irish work­
ingmen and foreign domestics.

I am afraid their social eclat will 
profit them nothing, but rather that 
they will have proven themselves 
most unprofitable servants in a 
spiritual way.

Of course the Master never held 
a brief against good manners, but 
rather approved them, but on the 
other hand, He never intended that 
good manners should be a substitute 
for personal kindness to His own 
children, for He chooses to identify 
Himself with the least and not with 
the most cultured of our kind.

A big rich church is not neces­
sarily a spiritual power; it may be 
merely hopelessly fat.

Christ had perfect manners, but 
He was not satisfied to be merely a 
gentleman; He was a gentleman who 
showed His gentleness by His service 
to His inferiors.

Cheerful Confidences
By George Parkin Atwater

ONLY A MILLION 
T^HE National Church is about a

million dollars in debt.
That does not seem so enormous 

when we read the statistics of the 
Church. We have about one mil­
lion communicants. The National 
Church could clear off that debt by 
passing the hat and having every 
member put in one dollar.

But of more consequence than 
clearing the debt is the discovery 
of the cause of the debt.

I am fairly familiar, as an out­
sider, with a corporation that does 
an annual business of about one 
hundred million dollars. In a re­
cent year they made little or no 
profit on their annual business. I 
discovered that the officers of that 
corporation, while disturbed at the 
lack of profits, were tremendously 
concerned with the reasons for that 
unfortunate outcome of a year’s 
work. They set to work not primar­
ily to do more business, but to cor­
rect the conditions in the operation 
of their corporation, which caused 
the profitless year.

So the Church should analyze the 
conditions.

We all agree that the National 
Church is carrying on a great work. 
To curtail its work is not only to 
lose opportunity, but to lose the 
value of work, and of investment in 
its operation and material structure. 
The total loss would be far in ex­
cess of the economy effected by cur­
tailment.

The National officers would say,

no doubt, that the debt was incurred 
because the various dioceses did not 
pay their assigned quotas. That is 
no doubt true. The work of the Na­
tional Church is dependent upon 
the ability of each and every diocese 
to raise the full 100 per cent of its 
diocesan objective each year.

If any diocese fails to raise its 
full objective, that failure is ulti­
mately registered on the books of 
the National Church, and emerges 
as debt on the National Church.

What is wrong with the system? 
In my opinion the weak spot is the 
system of percentages. The Na­
tional Church receives a fixed per­
centage of the amount raised by 
each diocese.

Let us see how this operates.
The national budget is, for ex­

ample, $4,500,000. From the dio­
cese of X is expected $50,000. Un­
less the National Church gets $50,- 
000 from the diocese of X  the Na­
tional Church will incur a debt equal 
to X ’s failure to reach $50,000.

Now what does the diocese of X 
do? It says, “ We will give you 50 
per cent of what we are able to 
raise in the annual campaign.”

That means that the diocese must 
raise $100,000 in cash if it is to 
pay the National Church $50,000. 
If the diocese succeeds in raising 
only $80,000, then the National 
Church gets $40,000 and (unless it 
has a surplus somewhere) it in­
curs a debt of $10,000.

If the rate of 50 per cent were 
uniform throughout the Church 
(and it is not) this division of pro­
ceeds presupposes the assumption 
that the objects for which each dio­
cese expends $50,000 are of equal 
importance with the objects for 
which the National Church expends 
$50,000. I have no means of know­
ing if this is true.

The remedy for the recurring 
debt of the National Church seems 
to be clear. The National Church 
should reduce its budget to the low­
est possible figure consistent with 
conserving work already under­
taken. The amount set up in this 
budget should be apportioned among 
the diocese. The full amount o f  
that apportionm ent falling upon any 
diocese should be paid in full to the 
National Church from  the proceeds 
o f  the campaign, before any amount 
is used fo r  diocesan purposes.

The National Church would then 
have no debt. It would depend on 
legacies, on special gifts, and on an 
annual increasing apportionment, to 
enlarge its work.

If the National apportionment 
were wisely and fairly made the 
dioceses would not suffer in the long 
run. The dioceses would examine 
the National budget with more care, 
because each diocese would have to

pay a certain portion of it in full. 
Today the dioceses have only a re­
mote concern for the national bud­
get, because they are not compelled 
to pay in full.

Likewise the diocese would exer­
cise very great care with its own 
budget. Under the present system 
there is the possibility of the diocese 
setting up an elaborate budget pro­
gram in order to justify its claim 
for its percentage of the amount 
raised.

Under the present system the Na­
tional Church and the dioceses are 
in competition with each other. 
They should be put into co-operation 
with each other.

The Rev. W. T. Hooper, rector of 
St. John’s Church, Hartford, Conn., 
is on a six weeks’ trip to Europe.

Preacher, Pulpit 
and Pew
By E. P. Jots

The world is full o’ ruts, my boy, 
Some shaller and some deep;

An’ every rut is full of folks as 
High as they can heap.

Each one that’s growlin’ in th’ ditch 
Is growlin’ at his fate,

An’ wishin’ he had got his chance 
Befor’ it was too late.

They lay it all on some one else, or 
Say ’twas just their luck—

They never once consider that ’twas 
Caused by lack o’ pluck.

But here’s the word o’ one that’s 
lived

Clean through, from soup to nuts: 
The Lord don’t send no derricks 

’round
T’ hist folks out o’ ruts.

A  Suggestion

CHECK 1 OR 2, FILL IN AND 
MAIL

t h e  w it n e s s ,
6140 Cottage Grove Avenue,

Chicago, Illinois.
1. Send............................ copies commencing

September first 
October first

I understand the cost to be 3c a copy, 
payable quarterly, or when I notify you 
to discontinue the bundle.
2. Do NOT write me of the BUNDLE 
PLAN, for I am not interested in it.

IName ....................................................................

Street ..................................................................

City ....................................................... .
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Dr. Abbott Finds Boy 
Preacher in the East

Eastern Editor Thinks That Episco­
pal Parsons Can Learn Much 

A bout Preaching from  
Others

USE MORE ILLUSTRATIONS

By Rev. H. P. Almon Abbott
I have always told my people to 

attend any church of any denomina­
tion in the summer, rather than stay 
away from divine worship because 
there does not happen to be an 
Episcopal Church within walking or 
motoring distance. Last Sunday, I 
■followed my own advice. I went to 
a Baptist Church in the evening, 
"having officiated in my own little 
summer church some four miles 
-away in the morning. I am glad I 
W’ent!

The sermon was on “ Traffic Sig­
nals,”  and it was delivered by a 
young man, still in the seminary, 
twenty-four years of age! It was 
'“heart stuff”  without a doubt, and it 
discovered its hearers “ just where 
they were.”  It discovered me, and 
that is saying much— for a preacher 
is the hardest person in the world 
to be affected for righteousness by 
any sermon, and I am no exception 
to the rule!

The red light: danger. The yel­
low light: caution. The green light: 
go ahead. There you have the three 
points, the skeleton of the discourse, 
and, simple as simple could be. 
God’s red lights, as recorded in His 
Holy Word, such as “ Cease from 
Evil,”  “ Whatsoever a man soweth, 
etc.,”  “ Now is the accepted time, 
now is the day of salvation.” God’s 
yellow lights as recorded in His Holy 
Word; all the BEWARES of Scrip­
ture. And, as you know, their name 
is legion. There are too many to 
quote. God’s green lights, to be 
found in the Old and New Testa­
ments : all the “ goes,” all the 
“ strives,”  all the “ forward marches,” 
and all the affirmative counsellings. 
We must “ stop,” we must “beware;” 
but, eventually, we must go ahead. 
No life gets anywhere until it 
MOVES somewhere. Simple? Aye, 

‘ simple to a degree. But, not too 
simple to help a sophisticated min­
ister of Christ, and many more be­
side.

Work it out for yourself, Mr. 
Parson, and, then, preach it and see 
whether or not the sermon is more 
appreciated than the intellectual es­
says with which, perchance, you 
have recently been befogging your 
congregation. Something concrete, 
you see, related to life— the abstract 
conspicuous by its entire absence. 
Heart throbs in it. Warning in it,-.

T H E  W I T N E S S

and God knows how much all of us 
need that! And salvation in it. 
Why, I feel sure that were I to 
preach it as I heard it to my own 
congregation, we would have con­
verts to Christianity lining the chan­
cel steps! And, that would be a 
truly remarkable thing in any Epis­
copal Church!

Here are some of the stories that 
went to illustrate the several points. 
The sort of stories, of course, that it 
would be impossible to relate from 
an Episcopal pulpit; but, homely 
stories that reached the risibilities, 
and through the risibilities the en­
during consciousness of the kind of 
people who were present at the ser­
vice.

“ I do not know what it means to 
‘be lost’ ; but, I know that you may 
be lost. I rather imagine that we 
are lost at the beginning, not at the 
end— certainly not at the end if we 
accept Christ. A friend of mine in 
a motor car the other day was trying 
to find a friend of his whose house 
was off the beaten track, somewhere 
in the woods. He motored and mo­
tored, and eventually he came to a 
sign on a fence, evidently painted 
by someone with a misplaced sense 
of humor, which read as follows: 
‘When you reach here you are lost.’ 
But, as a matter of fact, my friend 
had been lost a long time before 
that— when he left the highway.

“ I do not know what it means to 
be lost; but, I believe that any one 
of us may be lost. I get dressed 
some morning. I put on and button 
my vest. There are so many but­
tons, so many button holes. When 
I reach the end of the buttons, I 
discover that there is one button 
hole remaining! What is the mat­
ter? I am lost, so far as buttoning 
the vest is concerned. I go back 
and find that I made a mistake at 
the very beginning. I placed the 
second button in the first button 
hole! I was lost long before I had 
come to the last button.”

“ Beware of hypocrisy.”  One of 
the yellow lights. The hypocrite is 
not only the man who pretends to be 
better than he is. The hypocrite is, 
also, the man who pretends to be 
worse than he is. For instance: One 
of our professors in the seminary de­
lighted in rising up in every prayer 
meeting and calling himself, ‘A 
miserable worm of the dust.’ He al­
ways said it with such unctuous fer­
vor that some of us came to the con­
clusion that he did not altogether 
mean what he said. On the street 
one day, therefore, we saw the old 
hypocrite and called out, ‘Hello! 
You old miserable worm of the 
dust!’ I tell you we would be run­
ning still, had the professor been a 
younger man than he was.”

All honor to these men, Baptists, 
( Continued on page 14)
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Christians Gather
From Far Corners

Stockholm C onference Gets Under 
W ay W ith Large Attendance 

o f  Am erican Churchmen

FU LL PROGRAM

The Stockholm Conference, offi­
cially the Church Conference on 
Christian Life and Work, opens next 
week. It is sure to be a great con­
ference regardless of whether or 
not definite action is taken, for the 
attendance is large, and the per­
sonnel the finest. There is a large 
representation registered from Eng­
land, while 150 Americans are en­
rolled, including representatives of 
all the Protestant churches with the 
exception of the Southern Baptists. 
The Episcopal Church is to be rep­
resented by Bishop Brent, Bishop 
Perry, Rev. Floyd W. Tomkins, Jr., 
Rev. Prof. Norman Nash, represent­
ing the Church League for Indus­
trial Democracy, and the Rev. Hor­
ace Fort, secretary of the Berkeley 
Divinity School. Following is a 
general outline of the program:

1. — The Church’s obligation in 
view of God’s purpose for the 
world.

2. ^-The Church and economic and 
industrial problems.

3. — The Church and social and 
moral problems.

4. — The Church and international 
relations.

5. — The Church and Christian 
education.

6. —-Methods of cooperative and 
federative efforts by the Christian 
communions.

The conference will try to secure 
a fuller unity of spirit and action 
throughout Christendom in giving 
effect to the social implications of 
the Gospel. Before it actually 
opens, special commissions will be 
set up to investigate the reports al­
ready sent from various national 
groups, and out of them will be 
formulated definite findings to be 
submitted to the conference for dis­
cussion and agreement. It should 
be distinctly understood that the 
conference will not concern itself 
with faith and order. Many diffi­
culties are in the way of finding a 
general expression that will apply 
equally to conditions operating in 
different parts of the world, but it 
will be a great gain to get together 
and face common problems, to 
create an atmosphere of cooperation 
and to recognize that the one solu­
tion of the world’s ills is to be found 
in the application of principles 
which the Church is the custodian.
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Christian Education 
A n  English Problem

English Churchmen Discuss the R e­
port o f  the Education Commis­

sion at Their Assem bly

EXTREM ISTS A C T IV E

By Rev. A. Manby Lloyd 
The Church Assembly has been 

considering the Report of the Edu­
cation Commission and the Bishop 
of Wakefield moved that the Commis­
sion be permitted to consider the 
report at a later date, pending cer­
tain proposals likely to emanate from 
local authorities, particularly in Lan­
cashire. Several speakers suggested 
that enthusiasm for Church schools 
and the denominational principle was 
fast rising, while Lady Eve said it 
was better to have a bad class-room 
and a Church teacher than a good 
class-room and a teacher who did not 
hold the faith.

The Bishop of Manchester said 
that the Church schools were an as­
set they could bargain with and if 
they could get good terms they 
might go on to consider the religious 
instruction of children in non-Church 
schools.

Dr. Geraldine Hodgson asked 
whether anyone could imagine St. 
Athanasius and Arius sitting down 
together to make a provided syllabus. 
There was nothing to keep Arius out, 
and that was enough to knock the 
bottom out of Church schools. The 
end of education was character, and 
character could not be built upon in­
definiteness and “ slop.”

Lord High Cecil wanted nothing 
that was contrary to the interests of 
Nonconformist's. He did not object 
to the Bishop of Liverpool’s amiabil­
ity toward them, but in dealing with 
Parliament and the Board of Edu­
cation a temperate and judicious 
firmness was far more valuable than 
amiability. They were not to “ sing 
small”  when they sent back the re­
port, not to water the wine, but to 
see that it was the pure juice of the 
grape.

* * *
While the modern Anglicans are 

moving heaven and earth to get rid 
of the “ extremists”  who have adopt­
ed “ Benediction” or services of 
“Adoration,”  the latter are by no 
means inclined to alter their tactics 
or to keep silent. Snobbery is ram­
pant in the Church of England and 
the easiest way to kill a movement is 
to suggest it originates from non­
graduates and slum priests.

The moderates will be disabused 
as time goes on: Meanwhile Fr. Whit­

by,, of St. Mary’s, Graham Street, the 
mecca of the “ swell”  Anglo-Catho- 
lics, wrote to the Church Times to 
say the arguments against the cultus 
of the Blessed Sacrament are based 
on a false assumption, viz, that any 
“ use”  is being. made of the Blessed 
Sacrament in that service which has 
unfortunately come to be called 
“ Devotions.”  It is essentially, he 
says, the rendering of worship to our 
Lord present in this Mystery and 
what they demand is the liberty to 
give and not the right to receive 
something. Anyone grasping this sim­
ple distinction will understand why 
they are unable to make acts of self- 
sacrifice in the matter.

While the Catholic extremists are 
lying low and abiding their time, 
knowing that no power on earth can 
shift them and persecution can only 
assist them, the “ Orange” extrem­
ists have raised the already high 
temperature by several degrees. At 
the great Orange Demonstration at 
Liverpool they denounced a friend of 
mine, the Rev. J. J. R. Armitage, 
who might truthfully be described as 
a mild kind of Tory evangelical, as a 
“ Jesuit in disguise.” Nothing more 
ludicrous has been seen for years 
than the spectacle of Brother Walk­
er and other prominent leaders tear­
ing off the once loved collars and 
regalia and solemnly trampling them 
in the dust.

STUDENT CENTRE FOR 
IO W A STATE

Individuals and parishes in the 
Diocese of Iowa have given $7000 
for the rebuilding and furnishing of 
a Student Center at the State Univer­
sity o f  Iowa, located at Iowa City. 
Trinity Parish of Iowa City gave 
approximately two-thirds of this sum.

The new house will be dedicated by 
the Rt. Rev. Theodore N. Morrison, 
D. D., Bishop of the Diocese of Iowa, 
on September 27th and turned over 
to the parish for its own work and 
work with students. The house will 
be the headquarters of the Morrison 
Club which is the Iowa City unit of 
the National Student Council.

The house, as at present completed, 
is the first unit in plans for building 
a large guild hall, chapel, and en­
largement of the Church. It is also 
planned to brick veneer the entire 
group of buildings.

Henry Calmeise is a negro boy in 
Cincinnati who heard a cry for help 
as he was passing along by a creek, 
the other day, and diving in, rescued 
a white boy whose body was caught 
in the mud under twelve feet of 
water. Calmeise is a member of St. 
Andrew’s Church, Cincinnati.

Page Nine

League of Nations
the Leading Topic

Chatauqua Conference on Interna­
tional Relations Is Considered a 

a Successful Start

TO  BE HELD AN N U ALLY

The first Chatauqua Conference on 
International Relations from a Chris­
tian point of view came to a close 
on July 25th. Those sponsoring the 
conference feel satisfied that a good 
beginning has been made and plan 
now to hold a similar conference 
annually. The idea is to discuss much 
the same matters that come before 
the Williamstown Conference, but to 
discuss them frankly from a Chris­
tian point of view.

Most everything that was said at 
the Chatauqua meeting has been said 
before, and.by the same people. For 
instance, Mr. George W. Wickerman, 
who is always introduced as a former 
Attorney General of the United 
States, spoke long and hard for the 
League of Nations. He has done it 
before, though perhaps never more 
eloquently.

Bishop F. J. McConnell, Methodist 
bishop of Pittsburgh pleaded for a 
better understanding of our neigh­
bors in the south.

Mr. James G. McDonald, president 
of the Foreign Policy Association, 
told the conference all about the 
League of Nations at work. Then 
Count Michimasa Soyeshima of Ja­
pan spoke on the opium problem, and 
stressed the necessity of a just set­
tlement of the China situation if 
the world is to remain at peace.

John Jesudason Cornelius, a Brit­
ish Indian and professor at Lucknow 
University said that the east was de­
termined to maintain their own civi­
lization without the interference of 
the west. Then they let Mr. Mc­
Donald plead for the League of Na­
tions again. Finally Stanley High, 
who has traveled extensively in Rus­
sia as a representative of the Metho­
dist Church, told the group that it 
was time to recognize Russia, “ which 
is not as bad as it is painted.”

ORDAIN M ETH ODIST PASTO R

In Trinity Church, Toledo, on 
Sunday, July 26th James Roy Colby 
was ordained Deacon by the Rt. Rev. 
William A. Leonard, D. D., Bishop 
of Ohio. Preacher, Rev. B. Z. Stam- 
baugh; Presenter, Rev. A. J. J. 
Gruetter.

Mr. Colby was formerly a Metho­
dist minister. He is curate in Trinity 
Church, Toledo.
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News Paragraphs of 
the American Church

Diocese o f  Georgia Meets its Quota 
fo r  Both General and Diocesan 

W ork fo r  First Half

SPECIAL PREACHERS

In a financial statement issued last 
week by the diocese of Georgia, 
showing the receipts from the can­
vass to June 1st, four parishes and 
fifteen missions are showed to have 
met the minimum due on their 
pledges, and some on their entire 
quota. The total amount received 
to June first was a bit over ten thou­
sand dollars, an amount greater than 
the minimum amount of the budget 
quota for both the General Church 
and their diocese.

Hs H* H*

Bishop Lines dedicated the new 
St. Agnes Church, East Orange, New 
Jersey, in June, the occasion also 
marking the seventh anniversary of 
the rectorship of Rev. W. W. S. Ho- 
henschild. Within the past year the 
parish has also built a new rectory.

Hi Hi Hi
The diocese of Springfield has four 

boys in Brotherhood camps this sum­
mer. The diocese has also sent Miss 
Nellie Smith, who recently came to 
the diocese from Kansas, and who is 
a trained worker in religious educa­
tion to the Sewanee Conference.

H« Hi Hi
Bishop Roots of China was the 

preacher last Sunday at Grace 
Church, New York. Bishop Cook of

PAlR ISH P A P E R S
Any church, school or class can 
publish a parish paper by using our 
co-operative plan. A parish paper 
fills empty pews, keeps community 
informed, speeds up church work, 

Free Samples and Particulars. 
Our plan provides a paper for your 
church without cost to you.

The National Religious Press 
Witness Grand Rapids, Mich.

Did You Have 
Whooping Cough
when you were a child? Remember 
the stuff mother rubbed on your 
chest that loosened the phlegm and 
brought relief so quickly?
It's called R och e ’ s E m brocation  
and is still aiding thousands of 
little ones throughout the land. 

E ffective fo r  crou p  and 
co ld s  on. the chest to o  

Sold by All Druggists, or
E. FOUGERA & CO.. Inc., New York

Fights Whooping Cough and Croup

Delaware preached at the Cathedral 
boys in Brotherhood camps this sum­
mer. The diocese has also sent Miss 
Nellie Smith, who recently came to 
the diocese from Kansas, and who is 
of St. John the Divine.

* * *
Rev. Milo Gates of the Chapel of 

the Intercession, New York, was the 
preacher last Sunday at Trinity 
Church, Boston.

H: Hi H*

Full program at Taylor Hall. 
Young girls are meeting there now. 
From the 18th to the 25th of this 
month the women of the choir of the 
church of the Ascension, Chicago, 
have their vacation there. The last 
four days ,of the month there is to 
be a conference of leaders of young 
people. The first week of September 
the young people of Chicago have 
their annual conference there, and 
this is to be followed by a confer­
ence of laymen.

* H= *
The Rev. George Frazier Miller, 

rector of St. Augustine’s, Brooklyn, 
New York, a congregation of colored 
people, is leading a revolt against the 
presidency of Dr. Stanley Durkee at 
Howard University. Mr. Miller is the 
president of the alumni association. 
The chief complain against Dr. Dur­
kee is that he has militarized the in­
stitution. A year ago there was a 
strike of the undergraduates as a 
protest against his methods.

Saint Mary's
Knoxville, 111.

A superior school. High school, college, 
preparatory, and two years advanced work 
for high school graduates. Art, music, ex­
pression and dramatics, secretarial and busi­
ness courses. For catalogue address the 
Principal.

•Harnmrt piare fournil 
3For (tels

Gambier, Ohio
MISS SARRIETTE MERWIN. Principal.

THE
CHURCH TRAINING

AND
DEACONESS HOUSE

OF PENNSYLVANIA
Trains Women for Foreign, Do­
mestic or City Mission work, 
Church Social Service, leaders in 
Religious Education, Parish work­
ers and Deaconesses.

Address
DEACONESS CLARA M. CARTER 

T08 Spruce St.__________Philadelphia, Pa.

The Rev. Herbert Lewis-Jones, 
Priest-in-charge of St. Thomas’ 
Church, Farmingdale, Long Island, 
has accepted a call to become rector 
of St. John’s Church, Bayonne, New 
Jersey, succeeding the Rev. Robert 
F. Lau, D. D., who has been ap­
pointed to the Foreign-born Depart­
ment of the National Council. Ad­
dress after Sept. 1st, St. John’s 
Church, Bayonne, New Jersey.

Hs H* *

Christ Church, Eau Claire, Wis­
consin, has just purchased the house 
adjoining the rectory. It was bought 
as a protection to the Church proper­
ty. The parish now owns four out 
of the five lots in the block.H: H* Hi

Second annual conference of the 
Girls’ Friendly in Iowa was held at 
Lake Okoboji, July 18th-25th. There 
were 121 present. Miss May Case 
Marsh, national secretary was the 
leader. Bishop Morrison, Bishop 
Longley, four rectors, and Mrs. L. 
A. Jones, the diocesan president of

CHURCHMEN’S PILGRIMAGE TO THE 
HOLY LAND

Under the direction of Bishop Shayler of 
Nebraska

April 9 — June 3, 1926. Endorsed by Bish­
ops and leading clergymen. Price exceed­
ingly moderate.

OBJECTIVES PRIMARILY RELIGIOUS 
Address

BUSINESS MANAGER, CHURCHMEN’S 
PILGRIMAGE

442-D Park Square Building, Boston, Mass.

St. A lban’s School
For Boys

on the Waterman Foundation
Sycamore, Illinois

Sixty miles west of Chicago on the C. G. 
W. Ry. Motor Route: Roosevelt and Lin­
coln Highways.

A School that develops the Whole Boy.
Sympathetic guidance to the right choice of 

vocation.
Supervised Study insures Success in Schol­

arship.
Self-Help System teaches Real Democracy.
Student Government develops leadership 

and co-operation.
Sports for every boy build healthy bodies.
Social life makes gentlemen.
A Lower School, grades 5 and 6.
A Junior High School, grades 7, 8 and 9.
An Upper School, grades 10, 11, 12, and 

Post Graduate Courses.
Boys are entering Hobart, St. Stephen’s, 

Swarthmore, Princeton, Wisconsin, and Ken­
yon this coming Fall.

Boys were enrolled this last year from Illi­
nois, Iowa, Indiana, Connecticut, Pennsylva­
nia, Ohio, Tennessee, Louisiana, New York, 
Minnesota, Wisconsin, North Dakota, Colo­
rado, California, Cuba, and Porto Rico.

Fifteen over capacity last year. Provision 
is now being made for an increased capa­
city.

Non-Military and moderate rate.
Thirty-sixth year opens September 1-6, 1925.
Write the Headmaster, Box 1001, Syca­

more, Illinois.
Chicago Office: 1410 Tower Building, 6 

Michigan Avenue, Wednesdays from 10:30 ts 
2 :00.
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the Woman’s Auxiliary, were present 
during the -meetings.

* * *
Very successful summer confer­

ence in Los Angeles. Bishop San­
ford’s conferences with the clergy, 
and the course by the Rev. C. Ran­
kin Barnes and Miss Florence New- 
bold on Young People’s Problems 
were among the most popular 
courses. The lectures by Miss Miriam 
Van Water on Social Service were 
very well attended and aroused much 
interest. The course by Bishop 
Stevens on Art was the most largely 
attended course in the conference. 
There were about 200 in attendance. 

* * *
It is probable that the consecra­

tion of the Rev. Ernest M. Stires as 
Bishop Coadjutor of Long Island will 
not take place until after the Gen­
eral Convention. November 24th has 
been mentioned as a date.

* * *
The Rev. Samuel A. B. Mercer of 

Toronto, Canada, is preaching this 
month at Trinity Church, New York.

H* H« H«

St. George’s, Englewood, Colo., 
opened less than two years ago, has 
been very successful. A monthly 
sum is being put aside for clearing 
the indebtedness on the building, new 
pews have been installed, and new 
paving and grading carried out. A 
new reed organ has been bought, 
fitted with a noiseless motor; a parish 
monthly will be started in September, 
and the parish is easily meeting all 
its diocesan and national assessments. 
The organist, nine-year-old Ernest 
Wood, Jr., recently played on the mu­
nicipal organ in San Francisco. The 
Rev. George H. Holoran is in charge 
of the work.

* * *
On the fifty-third anniversary of 

his birth, Monday, Bishop Davies of 
the Episcopal diocese of Western 
Massachusetts was given a dinner at 
the Holiday House of the Girls’

FRECKLES
Don't Hide Them With a Veil; Remove 

Them With Othine—Doable 
Strength.

This preparation for the removal of 
freckles is so successful in removing 
freckles and giving a clear, beautiful com­
plexion, that it is sold by all drug and 
department stores with a guarantee to 
refund the money if it fails.

Don't hide your freckles under a veil or 
waste time on lemon juice or cucumbers; 
get an ounce of Othine and remove them. 
Even the first few applications should 
S“ °w «  wonderful improvement, some of 
the lighter freckles vanishing entirely.

Be sure to ask for the double strength 
othine; it is this that is sold on money- 
back guarantee.

We recommend Othine Complexion Soap 
for use with Othine, also as a shampoo— 
it s wonderful for bobbed hair—25c a cake 
at all drug or department stores or by 
maiL Othine Laboratories, Inc., Buffalo,

Friendly Society in the town of 
Washington. Fifteen rectors of 
Berkshire churches and a large num­
ber of women and girls of the dio­
cese were present, also Bishop Roots 
of Hankow, China, who spoke on the 
work in his diocese. The Rev. Ar­
thur L. Kinsolving, Amherst, also 
spoke. A birthday cake was sent by 
St. Stephen’s parish, Pittsfield. On 
behalf of the rectors of Berkshire 
parishes, the Rev. Charles J. Palmer, 
Lanesboro, presented Bishop Davies 
with three recent works on theology. 

* * *
By the will of the late ex-Senator 

Frederick F. Fuessenich, Torrington, 
Conn., Trinity Church of that city 
has received a bequest of $3000.

Hs H* ♦
St. Mark’s (Church, Washington, 

D. C., the Rev. William H. Pettus, 
rector, plans to lay the cornerstone 
of a new $40,000 addition to the 
parish house on St. Mark’s Day, 
1926.

Hi H* Hi
The cornerstone of the church, 

Rochester, N. H., was laid July 17 
with appropriate ceremonies. The 
new church building will replace the 
old chapel, which has been moved 
to the rear of the church lot. The 
ceremonies were opened by a cele­
bration of the Holy Communion, at 
9 a. m., by Archdeacon Arthur M. 
Dunstan. The cornerstone was laid 
at 4 p. m. by Bishop Parker, of New 
Hampshire, assisted by Archdeacon 
Dunstan, each giving an address.

* * *
Mrs. Hugh Bancroft, the donor of 

the carillon in St. Stephen’s Church, 
Cohasset, has arranged with Kamiel 
Lefevere to cancel his engagement at 
Malines and Bruges during August. 
He will remain in Cohasset and will 
give a recital every Sunday after­
noon and every Tuesday evening dur­
ing the month. The evening con­
certs will be given at the same hour

EVOLUTION
A  Witness To God 

By
REV. G. C. STEWART, D. D.
Lectures delivered at Prince­

ton, Northwestern and Wis­
consin Universities.

Every clergyman should have 
a supply on hand.

$3.00 for a dozen copies. 
35c for single copies.

WITNESS BOOKS
6140 Cottage Grove Ave. 

CHICAGO

Page Eleven

as heretofore, from 8 :30 to 9 :30, 
but the August Sunday afternoon re­
citals will be from 3 to 4 instead of 
from 12:30 to 1:30.

* H: *
The secular papers have a tremen­

dous advantage over those of us who 
trying to get out interesting re­

ligious papers. They can stir people 
with accounts of horse races, base­
ball games, prize fights: they have 
murders and suicides and divorces. 
All of those stirring events which we 
say should not be printed, but which 
most of us read. And, of course, 
elections, which are always exciting 
and thrilling.

Now, one of the big eastern dailies 
is turning to church elections to fur­
nish the thrills by telling the world 
who is apt to be the next presiding 
bishop. We can’t even do that with­
out being charged with “ playing poli­
tics”  . . . tough life, this of get­
ting out a Church paper. The east­
ern daily tells you that there are 
four likely men, Bishops Perry, of 
Rhode Island; Brent, of Western 
New York; Kinsolving, of Brazil, and 
Parsons, of California. The paper 
then tells you about each one, who 
low, ’ who is “ high,”  who can preach 

well and who can’t; how much the 
job pays and where the elected bishop 
is apt to live. It is really a shame 
that we can’t let our imagination run 
riot like that. We wouldn’t name

SP IR ITU A L R A D IO
By the Late

ARCHBISHOP DU VERNET 
Paper Covered, 25c.; Clothbound, 50c.

o  • «, ,  _  t c u a u t u i s  t i l l
Spiritual Dynamics, including studies in 
Divine Healing, Creative Thought, Telep­
athy and Cultural Psychology.

Also describes the Archbishop’s original 
experiments in the Scientific Transmis­sion or Thought.

Published by
THE SOCIETY OF THE NAZARENE 

Mountain Lakes, New Jersey
Sent postpaid on receipt o f price 

indicated above

ADDRESS CH ANGED

HMmurtal (&lagg
Minim nig

3h*anz gtagrr
of fHmttrij, Jlttr.

Safiepif $1. Xrfljj, Prraiiirnl
Bole Agents in the United States and 

Canada for

IHayrr Sc (Ha. nf
1220-1222 Woolworth Bldg., New York 

Telephone Whitehall 3631
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the likely candidate . . . simply
describe him, and do it with all of 
the gusto of a man on the inside who 
really knows but can not tell. And 
I dare say that our guess would be 
just about as near right as is the 
guess of the eastern daily, whose 
editor probably got his information 
from a gossipy parson who had sum­
mer days hanging heavy on his hands 
and dropped in for a chat.

* * *
Old, historic Calvary Episcopal 

Church at Fletcher, close to Ashe­
ville, N. C., is soon to be entirely re­
decorated. Beautiful electric fix  ̂
tures have been installed in the 
church, a new heating plant is to be 
placed before the autumn and a fund 
for a $6,000 pipe organ with electric 
chimes and harp accompaniment is

Rt. Rev. I. P. Johnson, D. D., President 
Rt. Rev. Fred Ingley, D. D., Bishop Co­

adjutor
Janies H. Cowles, Secretary 
W. W. Grant, Jr., Atty. At Law

about to be started. The Rev. Clar­
ence Stuart McClellan, Jr., is rector 
of this church. Congregations num­
bering from 500 to 1,000 persons are 
in attendance at the special services 
held in this church, when the Jewish 
rabbi, Roman Catholic priest and 
ministers of various Protestant de­
nominations take part in services de­
signed for community interests. The 
Church school has shown a remark­
able growth, the regular congrega­
tions on Sunday mornings are in­
creasing in attendance and interest 
and the various parish organizations 
are active and carrying on the pro­
grams of this old shrine with great 
enthusiasm and interest. Prepara­
tions are now under way at this 
church for the “ Bill Nye” celebra­
tion, August 23-25. Nye is buried

Rev. Frederick W. Oakes, B. D., 
Chairman, Vice President and Treas. 

Rodney J. Bardwell, Atty. At Law 
J. M. Kennedy, Jr.

in the churchyard and was for many 
years a member of this church.

* * *
Lloyd Robert Fowzer, M. D., has 

been secured for missionary work in 
Liberia. It is a great step forward for 
the Liberian Mission to have Dr. 
Fowzer appointed, after a long per­
iod of helplessness due to their hav­
ing no physician. He will institute 
medical work among the two million 
inhabitants of Liberia, with the hope 
of penetrating from time to time in­
to the regions away from the coast, 
among the forty tribes of natives, 
who have practically no opportunity 
for medical help.

It is Bishop Overs’ plan to make 
the general headquarters at St. Tim­
othy’s Hospital, Cape Mount, but to 
provide for itinerant work on the 
part of the doctor and nurses to 
Monrovia, Cape Palmas, and especi­
ally the interior parts of the Liberian 
Republic.

Dr. Fowzer is a resident of Man- 
awa, Wisconsin, a member of Trinity 
Parish, Oshkosh, Wisconsin, a grad­
uate of the Chicago School of Medi­
cine and Surgery, who has seen army 
service and been in private practice 
in his home city.

He sailed the 27th of June from 
New York for England, where he 
plans to take a special course in trop­
ical medicine. He was to sail for 
Liberia thereafter, with headquar­
ters at St. Timothy’s Hospital, Cape 
Mount.

BOARD AND ROOM
SISTERS OF THE HOLY NATIVITY— 

House of Retreat and Rest. Bay Shore, 
Long Island, iN. Y. References required.

ALTAR FURNISHINGS 
THE CATHEDRAL STUDIO AND SIS- 

ters of the Church (of London, Eng­
land). All Church embroideries and mate­
rials. Stoles with crosses from $7.50; 
burse and veil from $15. Surplices and ex­
quisite Altar linens. Church vestmeafe im­
ported free of duty. Miss L. V. Mackrille, 
11 West Kirke St., Chevy Chase, Washing­
ton, D. C. Tel. Cleveland 52.

ALBS, BIRETTAS, CASSOCKS, CHAS- 
ubles, Copes, Gowns, Hoods, Maniples, 

Mitres, Rochets, Stocks, Stoles, Surplices. 
Complete sets of best Linen Vestments 
with Outlined Cross, consisting of Alb 
Chasuble, Amice, Stole, Maniple and Girdle 
$35.00 and $22.00. Post free. MOWBiRAY’S, 
28 Margaret St., London, W. 1 and Oxford, 
England.

THE WARHAM GUILD—THE SECRE- 
tary will forward, free of charge, (1) * 

Catalogue of Vestments, Surplices, etc., (2) 
Examples of Church Ornaments, (3) Leaf­
let describing St. George’s Chapel, Wemb­
ley Exhibition, which was furnished by 
the Warham Guild. All work designed 
and made by artists and craftsmen. The 
Warham Guild, Ltd., 72 Margaret St., 
London, W. I.. England.

ALTAR GUILDS
PURE LINEN FOR ALL CHURCH USES 

—Special 36-in. 1800 universally liked for 
fine Surplices, $1.25 per yard. Write for 
samples. MARY FAWCETT, 115 Frank­
lin St., New York City.

FOR FURTHER INFORMATION APPLY TO

REV. FREDERICK W . OAKES, A . B., B. D. ■  
E THE OAKES HOME DENVER =
121 i i 111 ! m 11:1111 ! I il 111111111 ! 1111111 n 1111111111111111 ! 11111111111111 ! 1111111 ! 111111111111111111 m ! 111

iimmimiimmimmmimmimimmmmimmii immimmmmiimiimmimimiMi

| THE OAKES HOME |
E A  Church Home for Sick Strangers =
E Denver, Colorado E

"D UILT in 1894. Has cared for over 15,000 guests from 
every part of the country. The great purpose is to give 

a Churchly Home of refinement and spiritual help, to those 
obliged to seek renewed health away from home in this alti­
tude and unexcelled dry country of Colorado. Also to ex­
tend every means, sanitary and scientific, requisite to the 
proper caring for those sick with tuberculosis.

Each guest is free to choose his own physician, this giving 
greater opportunity to select from the excellent and skilled 
number in Denver, who have no superiors.

Rates, from $12.50 to $40 a week.
Rooms single or en suite

BOARD OF DIRECTORS

Copyright 2020. Archives of the Episcopal Church / DFMS.  Permission required for reuse and publication.



August 13, 1925 T H E  W I T N E S S Page Thirteen

SERVICES IN LEADING CHURCHES

CLEVELAND NEW YORK ST. PAUL

Trinity Cathedral
Very Rev. Francis S. White, D. D., Dean. 

Sundays at 8, 11 and 4.
Dally at 8, 11 and 4.___________________

BALTIMORE
Grace and St. Peter's
Park Ave. and Monument St. 

Rector: H. P. Almon Abbott, M.A., D.D. 
Sundays:

8 A. M.—Holy Communion.
11 A. M.—Morning Prayer and Sermon.

(First Sunday in each montn 
Holy Communion).

S P. M.—Baptisms.
8 P. M.—Evening Prayer and Sermon.

CHICAGO
Grace

St. Luke’s Hospital Chapel 
1416 Indiana Avenue 

(Lntil New Church Is Built)
Rev. Wm. Otis Waters, S.T.D., Rector 
Sunday Services: 8 and 11 A. M., 7:30 

P. M.

St. Paul's
Dorchester Ave. and Fiftieth St.

Rev. George H. Thomas, Rector. 
Sundays at 8, 9:30 and 11 A. M. and 

7:45 P. M.
Holy Days at 10 A. M.

The Atonem ent
5749 Kenmore Avenue 

Rev. Frederic S. Fleming, Rector. 
Sundays: 7:30, 9:30, 11 A. M.; 5 P. M. 
Daily: 7:30, 9:00 and 5:30.

(Fridays—10:30 additional).

St. Chrysostom's
1424 North Dearborn Parkway 

Rev. iNorman Hutton, S. T. D., Rector. 
Sundays: 8, 9:3Q, 11 and 4:30 P. M. 
Tuesdays at 10 A. M .; Thursdays at 8 

P. M.

EVANSTON

St. Luke's
Rev. G. C. Stewart, D. D., Rector 

Sundays: 7:30, 8:15, 11:00 and 4:80. 
Daily: 7:30 and 5:00.
All sittings free and unassigned.
From Chicago, get off at Main Street, 

one block east and one north.

BOSTON

Trinity
Copley Square

Rev. Henry K. Sherrill, Rector. 
Sundays: 8, Holy Communion; 9:30, 

Church School; 11, Morning Prayer and 
8ermon( first Sunday of month, Holv 
Communion and Sermon); 4, Service and 
Address; 5:30, Young Peoples Fellowship; 
7:30, Service and Address.

Wednesdays and Holy Days: 12:10, Holy 
Communion.

ATLANTIC CITY

The Ascension
Pacific and Kentucky Avenues 

Rev. H. Eugene Allston Durell, M. A. 
Sundays: 7:30, Eucharist; 10:30, Matins; 

12:00, Eucharist; 8:00, Evensong.
Daily: 7:30. Eucharist; 10:30, Matins, 

Monday, Tuesday, Saturday; Litany, Wed­
nesday. Friday; Eucharist, Thursday and 
Holy Days.

Cathedral o f St. John the 
Divine

Sunday Services: 8, 10:15 and 11 a. m .;4 p. m.
Week-day Services: 7:30 and 10 a. m .;

5 p. m. (Choral except Mondays ano 
Saturdays).

The Incarnation
Madison Avenue at 35th Street 

Rev. H. Percy Silver, S.T.D., Rector. 
Sundays: 8 and 11 a. m.

Trinity
Broadway and Wall Street 

Rev. Caleb R. Stetson, S.T.D., Rector 
Sundays: 7:30, 9:00, 11:30 and 3:30. 
Daily: 7:15, 12:00 and 4:45.

and Chapel Beloved Disciple
iRev. Henry Darlington, D. D., Rector. 
Sundays: 8, 10, 11 A. M. and 4:30 P. M. 
Saints’ Days: Holy Communion, 11 

A. M.

BUFFALO

St. Paul's Cathedral
Rev. Charles A. Jessup, D.D., Rector. 
Sundays: 8, 9 :30 and 11 A. M.
D aily: 8 and 12 A. M.
Holy Days and Thursdays: 11 A. M.

CINCINNATI

St. Paul's Cathedral
Corner Seventh and Plum 

Very Rev. Edgar Jones, Ph.D., Dean 
Sundays: 7:30, 11 A. M.. and 7:45 P. M.

Week Days: 7 :30 A. M.
Holy Days and Wednesdays, 10 A. M.

Christ Church
Rev. Frank H. Nelson and Rev. C. Russell 

Moodey, Clergy.
Sundays: 8:45 and 11 A. M. and 7:45 

P. M.
Daily: 12:10 P. M.
Saints’ Days: Holy Communion, 10 A. M.

DALLAS

St. Matthew's Cathedral
Very Rev. Robert S. Chalmers, Dean. 
Rev. B. L. Smith, Associate Priest. 

Sundays: 8 and 10:45 A. M. and 7:45 P. 
M.

Daily Services : 7 :30, 9:30 and 5 :30.

PHILADELPHIA

St. Jame's Church
22nd and Walnut Streets 

Rev. John Mockridge. Rector. 
Sundays: 8 and 11 A. M., 8 P. M.
Week days: 7:30 and 9 A. M., 6 P. M. 
Thursdays and Holy Days: 10 A. M.

Church o f St. John the 
Evangelist

Portland Ave. and Kent Street 
Rev. F. D. Butler, B. D., Rector 

SUNDAY SERVICES 
8 :00 A. M. Holy Communion.
11:00 A. M. Morning Prayer and Ser­

mon. (First Sunday in each month Holy 
Communion).

ALL WELCOME

MINNEAPOLIS

Gethsemane
4th Avenue South, at 9th Street.

Rev. Don Frank Fenn, B. D., Rector. 
Sundays: 8 and 11 A. M„ 7:45 P. M. 
Wednesdays, Thursdays and Holy 

Days.

ALBANY

A ll Saints Cathedral
Very Rev. Charles C. Williams Carver,

. B. D., Dean.
Sundays: 7:30, 9:45, 11:00 and 4 P. M. 
Week Days: 7:30, 9:00 and 5:30. Even­

song, Wednesdays and Fridays, the Lit­
any, 9:30; Thursdays and Holy Days, 
Eucharist, 11 A. M.

DENVER

St. John's Cathedral
14th Ave., Washington and Clarkson. 

Very Rev. D. B. Dagwell, Dean.
Rev. Jonathan Watson, D. D„ Assistant.

Sunday Services : 7 :30, l i  :00 A. M„
7:30 P. M. ; Church School, 9 ;30 A. M. ; 
Young People’s Society, 6:00 P. M.

MILWAUKEE

A ll Saints Cathedral
Cor. Juneau Ave. and Marshall St' 

Very Rev. C. S. Hutchinson, D. D., Dean. 
Sundays: 7:30, 11:00, 7:30i 
Week Days: 7:00 and 5:00.
Holy Days: 9:30.

St. Paul's
Cor. Marshall and Knapp Streets 

Rev. Holmes Whitmore, Rector 
Sundays: 8:00, 9:30, 11:00, 4:30.
Saints’ Days and Tuesdays, 9:30 a. m. 
Wells-Downer Cars to Marshall Street

St. Mark's
Hackett Ave. and Belleview Place.
Rev. E. Reginald Williams, Rector. 
Sundays 8:00, 9:30, 11:00 and 7:00. 
Gamma Kappa Delta Club 6:00 p. m. 
Sheldon B. Foote, Mus. Bac., F.A.G.O., 

Choirmaster.
Wells-Downer Cars to Belleview Place.

AUGUSTA, MAINE

St. Mark's
Rev. Stuart B. Purves, D.D., Rector 
Sundays: 7:30, 10:30, and 7:30 p. m. 
Daily: 8:30 a. m.
The Church attended by summer visitors 

within a radius of 50 miles.
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F IN D S  B O Y  P R E A C H E R

( Continued from page 8) 
Congregationalists, Methodists, and 
all the rest of them, who are speak­
ing the language of the people, who 
are translating the sublime into the 
speech of “ the daily round, the 
common task.”  We have MUCH to 
learn from them. They apparently 
appreciate the carpentership of 
their Lord, and the carpentership of 
many of His followers.

And, all this from a man twenty- 
four years ®ld, a man not, as yet, 
ordained, and a man who is preach­
ing on Sundays and working on 
weekdays during the summer that 
he may pay his way through the

T H E  W I T N E S S

seminary that is to prepare him to 
preach the Gospel of Christ! 
BRAVO! Majr the men in our own 
seminaries take notice. For, it was 
all extemporaneous, and devoid of 
sophomoric hesitancy.

August 13, 1925

The Rev. Garth Sibbald, Rock­
ford, Illinois, is spending the month 
of August in Colorado.

MEMORIAL,

SHATTUCK
A  Church School for Boys

For 59 years Shattuek has been a leader 
among college preparatory schools of the 
highest order. It is particularly noted for 

High Scholarship 
Manly Character 
Christian Citizenship 

A Military boarding school founded to 
train boys for service, not for profit. 
Boys may be entered at mid-year or fall 
Address the Rector, Shattuek School. Faribault, Minn.

A U G U ST  BARGAINS IN 
GOOD BOOKS

Historical Truth of Genesis 
By

REV. W. LOWNDES, M. A. 
A  $2.50 book for $1.50

PERSONAL RELIGION 
By

DEAN INGE 
$1.00 book for 75c

Historical Development of 
The Church 

By
BISHOP JOHNSON 

35c book for 20c
WITNESS BOOKS

6140 Cottage Grove Ave. 
CHICAGO

At a meeting of the Rector, Wardens, 
and Vestry of Trinity Episcopal Church, 
Fort Wayne, Indiana, held on Tuesday, 
June 9, 1925, being the first meeting after 
the death of Mr. Joseph Slater, for many 
years Senior Warden of Trinity Church, 
the Rev. Louis N. Rocca, was appointed 
to prepare the following resolutions:

W HEREAS: It has pleased Almighty 
God to take unto Himself the soul of our 
departed brother and friend, Joseph Slater, 
Therefore be it resolved:

FIRST: Trinity Church owes much to 
his faithful and untiring efforts and inter­
est in all phases of parochial and Dio­
cesan work. As a Vestryman for upward 
of thirty years, and as Senior Warden over 
a long period, he was an inspiring ex­
ample to his fellow-members of the con­
gregation of Trinity Church. Always 
cheerful and kindly, he endeared himself to 
the hearts of all, gaining hosts of friends 
among all types and classes. His devo­
tion to his Church was most notably ex­
emplified by the fact that ill health alone 
prevented his attendance at Divine Ser­
vices. For forty years, he had been pre­
sent at every Easter Service. His memory 
will long remain enshrined with gratitude 
in the hearts of the members of Trinity 
Parish where he will be greatly missed.

SECOND: That we extend to his family 
our sincerest sympathy in their irreparable 
loss, with assurances of our prayers that 
God may comfort and sustain them.

TH IRD : That these resolutions be sent 
to the Church papers, be spread on the 
records of Trinity Parish, and after prop- 
per engrossment be sent to the widow.

MOUNT SAINT GABRIEL 
Peekskill-on-Hudson 

NEW YORK

Boarding and day school for girls, under the care of the Sisters of 
Saint Mary.

Modern fireproof buildings, including class rooms, dormitories, infirm­
ary and gymnasium in process of construction.
College preparatory, general and music courses.
Two years post-graduate work.
Extensive recreation grounds. Supervised athletics.

For children in first six grades
Separate dormitories, and school buildings
Special staff of Sisters and Teachers

FOR CATALOGUE ADDRESS THE SISTER SUPERIOR
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Three-year undergraduate course of 
prescribed and elective study.

Fourth-year course for graduates, o f­
fering larger opportunity for specializa­
tion.

Provision for more advanced work, lead­
ing to degrees of S. T. M. and S. T. D.

ADDRESS

THE DEAN
1 Chelsea Square New York City

Episcopal Theological School
Cambridge, Mass.

Affiliated with Harvard University
For catalogue, address 

THE DEAN

Berkeley Divinity 
School

Middletown. Connecticut 
Address:

SEV. W11,1,1 AM PALMER LADD, Dean.

DIVINITY SCHOOL IN 
PHILADELPHIA

Undergraduate and Graduate Courses. 
Privileges at University of Pennsylvania.

Address:
DEAN BARTLETT, 42nd and Locust Sts.

NASH O TAH  HOUSE  
THEOLOGICAL SEMINARY 

Founded 1842 
For Catalogue, Address 

THE DEAN Nashotah, Wis.

SEABUR Y-C A R LE TO N
THEOLOGY LIBERAL ARTS

Best Training — Minimum Cost

For information and catalogue write 
REV. FREDERICK KRAMER, Ph.D., D.D. 

beabnry Hall, Faribault, Minn.

The Protestant Episcopal Theo­
logical Seminary in Virginia

For catalogue and other information 
address the Dean.

REV. BERRYMAN GREEN, D.D. 
Theological Seminary Alexandria, Va.

ST. STEPHEN’S COLLEGE
A CHURCH COLLEGE OF ARTS AND 

LETTERS, with four years’ work, lead­
ing to the degree of B.A. It meets the 
highest standards of scholarship set by 
the Middle States College Association and 
features inexpensiveness of living, inti­
mate personal companionship of professors 
aijd students, and sincerity.

The fees are: For tuition, $250 a year; 
for a room, furnished and heated, $125 a 
year; for board in hall, $225 a year; a 
total of $600.

The College is equipped for teaching 
men who, after graduation, are going into 
business or into post-graduate schools of 
medicine, law, theology, journalism, or 
into classical, social or literary research. 
Address Bernard Iddingg Bell, President 

ANNANDALE-ON-HUDSON, N. Y.
(Railway Stations Barrytown)

HOBART COLLEGE
GENEVA. NEW YORK

“ The Oldest College of the Church”  
Founded 1822

Courses leading to the degrees of A.B. 
and B.S. A Faculty of thirty; equipment 
modern and complete. Accredited by the 
principal educational associations of the 
United States. Pleasant living conditions 
and moderate exDenses.

For Information, address
Rev. Murray Bartlett, D.D.,

President.

T R IN IT Y  CO LLEGE
HARTFORD, CONN.

For 102 Years a Personal College. 
Courses Leading to B. A. and B. S.

For information Address the Registrar.

ulfyp Sntmlbsun
Ilchester, Md.

CHURCH SCHOOL FOR BOYS 
College Preparatory and General Courses 
Religious Instruction along Catholic lines 

Individual Guidance.
Rector.

Rev. William A. McClentnen, D. D., 
Iiev. Herbert S. Hastings, Headmaster

RACINE COLLEGE SCHOOL
Founded 1852

Six-year College Preparatory Course, be­
ginning with Seventh Grade. Enrollment 
strictly limited to twenty boys per class. 
Every boy recites every lesson every day. 
Personal instruction, individual attention. 
Atmosphere that of a Christian home. 
Modified Military System. Strict require­
ments for admission.

Address: The Warden.
Racine College School, Racine, Wisconsin

H A R V A R D  SCHOOL 
Los Angeles, Calif.

A boarding and day school for boys, 
under auspices of the Episcopal Church! 

I College Preparatory, R. O. T. C.
| Twenty-sixth year opens .Sept. 15. 
ROBT. B. GOODEN, D.D., Headmaster

Virginia Episcopal School
LYNCHBURG. VIRGINIA 

Prepares boys at cost for college and uni­
versity. Moderate equipment. Healthy 
location in the mountains of Virginia, 
cost moderate, made possible through 
generosity of the founders. For cata­
logue apply to
REV. WILLIAM G. PENDLETON. D.D

St. Mary's School
Concord. N. H.

A HOME-LIKE SCHOOL FOR GIRLS 
College Preparatory and General Courses

MARY EVERETT LADD, B. L., 
Headmistress

H O W E  SCHOOL
HOWE, INDIANA

A Thorough and Select CHURCH SCHOOL 
for Boys.

Special attention given to College Prepa­
ration. The Lower School for Little Boys 
Entirely Separate.
Rev. Charles Herbert Young, M.A., Rector 

ADDRESS P. O. BOX S, HOWE, IND.

BETH ANY COLLEGE
A HOME SCHOOL FOR GIRLS 

Topeka, Kansas 
The Rt. Rev. James Wise, D.D., 
Bishop of the Diocese, President. 

Accredited High School and J unior Col­
lege. Unusual advantages in Music and 
Dramatic Art. 20-acre campus—out-of- 
door athletics.

St. Katharine's School
Davenport, Iowa

Under the care of the Sisters of St. Mary.
A thorough preparatory course for x 

limited number of girls.
School recommended by Eastern Col­

leges. Beautiful grounds. Outdoor sports 
and riding. Address

THE SISTER SUPERIOR

KEMPER HALL
Under the care of the Sisters of S. Mary. 
An Episcopal school for girls on North 
Shore of Lake Michigan, one hour from 
Chicago. College Preparatory and general 
courses. Music, Art, Domestic Science. 
Outdoor and indoor sports. Address, The 
Sister Superior.

CATHEDRAL SCHOOL FOR 
GIRLS

Florida State Accredited
Rt. Rev. Cameron Mann, D. D., President. 

General and elective courses. Faculty 17* 
Single rooms. Beautiful location. Climate 
makes outdoors the gymnasium. Terms $600. 
Address Registrar, Orlando, Florida.

Saint Margaret's Hall
Knoxville, 111,

A home-school for very young girls. Work 
from 1st to eighth grades. When necessary, 
pupils may remain the year round. For cata­
logue address Mrs. F. L. Carrington, Knox­
ville, 111.
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MARGARET HALL
Versailles, Kentucky
In the Heart of the Blue Grass 

Sara McDowell Gaither, A.B., Principal

A  W eek-end at Camp

College Preparatory Church School for Girls Where 
Those of Other Communions Are Welcomed.

OUR SYSTEM
Emphasis is placed upon the old-fashioned virtues of 

Truth, Obedience, Respect, Courtesy, Helpfulness.

Insistence is upon absolute Concentration in Study hours, 
Self - reporting and the Honor - System in all school

relationships.
Results of the system — Strict discipline, real intellectual 

development, contented girls.
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